UPSHUR COUNTY FOR UNION GROVE WSG, STEP #7218036

CONTRACT 3 - ROAD BORES (LABOR ONLY)

_ Tuesday, Juné 11, 2070 sl 10:00 e.m.

T BID TABULATION
I, S EL e - -
.- |
N R e ] Jaff Wilsen Boring Temy Black Construction Grady Crawford Construction Co., Inc.
ITEM QTY | UNIT CRIFT! Salillo, TX Alto, TX Longvisw, TX
SCHEDULE "A" BID ; o .
1| 2240 ] LF_|DIRECTIONAL BORE 8" RESTRAINED JOINT WATER MAIN $24.00 5 53,760.00 $35.00 5 78,400.00 |¢ $46.00 $ 107,520.00 [
2 760 | iF " |DIREGTIONAL BORE 4" RESTRAINED JOINT WATER MAIN §515.00 $ 26,400.00 $22.00 k) 38,720.00 §25.00 $ 44.000.00
3 100 | TF |BORE & INSTALL 15" SDR-35 PVC ENCASEMENT £30.00 $ 3,800.00 $75.00 5 7,600.00 §13500 |3 13,500.00
4 | B0 | LF |DRYBORE&INSTALL 12" X'0.375" STEEL ENCASEMENT PiPE_ $85.05 § 704400 $75.00 El §.,000.00 §14000 | § 11,200.00 |
5| "260 [ LF "[BORE & INSTALL 8" WATER MAIN UNDER DRIVES $30.00 $ £,400.00 $35.00 $ 8.800.00 |* [ §$45.00 s 12,600,00 |*
3 600 | LF |BORE &INSTALL 4" WATER MAIN UNDER DRIVES §1417 s 8,602.00 $22.00 § 1320000 $25.00 $ 15,000.00 |
7 320 | _LF "|BORE % INSTALL 3* 6CH. 40 PVC ENCASEMENT PIPE FOR LONG SERVICE $11.25 3 3,600.00 $25.00 3 6,000.00 $12.50 5 4,000.00
g 1 LS [TRENCH SAFETY $50.00 $ 50.00 $1.00 3 160 _NoBid 5 -
YGTAL AMOUNT SCHEDULE "A™ BID § 111,656.00 ’ $ 151,861.00 ! 3 185,840.00 |*
I—S"""‘Lc EDl E “B“ D Timnae . w— - v o _
1 2240 | LF |DIRECTIONAL BORE 8" RESTRAINED JOINT WATER MAIN $24.00 5 53,760,00 $35.00 $ 7840000 No Bid $ -
Tz 1760 | LF "|GIRECTIONAL BORE 6" RESTRAINED JOINT WATER MAIN $16.00 § 3168000 $3000 |8 52,800.00 NoBid |8 -
3 100 | LF |BORE & INSTALL 157 SDR-35 PVC ENCASEMENT $39.00 § 3,900.00 — $75.00 $ 7,500.00 _ No'Bid $ -
4 a0 LF__|DRY BORE & INSTALL 12°X 0.375" STEEL ENCASEMENT PIPE $88.05 $ 7.044.00 §75.00 $ 6,600.00 No Bid 5 -
"5 1 280 | LF |BORE &INSTALL 8" WATER MAIN UNDER DRIVES $30.00 5 840000 $35.00 5 5,800,001 NoBid |$ - 1
"B {800 | "LF |HORE & INSTALL 6~ WATER MAIN UNDER DRIVES ™ $18.30 $ 16.880.00 $30.00 3 18,000.00 § " No Brd $ -
7 320 | LF |BORE & INSTALL 2" SCH. 40 PV ENCASEMENT BiFE FOR LONG SERVICE $11.25 § 3,600.00 $25.00 $ 8,000.00 { No Bid s -
8 1 [S_|TRENGH SAFETY  §50.00 $ 60.00 $1.00 $ 1.00 No Bid $ -
I TOTAL AMOUNT SCHEDULE “B™ BID $ 119,414.60 — 3 169,001.00 ¢ $ -
N — - - * Conlractor used wrong bid form, " I* Conliagter vsed wrong Bid form and
_ - T T id not bid Schodufe 8", S -
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UPSHUR COUNTY FOR UNION GROVE WSC, STEP #7218036

CONTRACT 1 - MATERIALS ONLY FOR WATER METERS

“Tuesday, June 11, 2016 af 10:00 a.m, _

..BID TABULATION

I "1 Underground Utility Supply
ITEM | QTY | UNIT T DESCRIPTION _ Longview, TX
General ) } o
1 18 | EA_[Furnish Master Water Meters per Specifications 1§ 4,194.00 ;
0 i - N 5 4,194.00
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UPSHUR COUNTY FOR UNION GROVE WSC, STEP #7218035

CONTRACT 2 - MATERIALS ONLY FOR WATER MAINS

Tuesday, June 11, 2019 at 10:00 a.m.

BID TABULATION
I
N Hayes Pipe Supply, Inc. Core & Maln, LP
ITEM | QTY [UNIT BESCRIPTION Longvlew, TX Tyler, TX
SCHEDULE "A" BID
T _[10,600] LF [FURNISH 8" WATER'MAIN $502 | § 62,710.00 $6509 [ § 63,445.00
2| 1,500 | [F |FURNISH 8* WATER MAIN §286 | §  4.440.00 $304 |8 4.660.00
3_[13.800] LF [FURNISH 4" WATER MAIN $140 | $ 19,320.00 $i44 |5 1987200
4 | 20 | LF |FURNISH 2" WATER MAIN $043 |5 8.60 5054 | § 10.80
5 ] 2180 | LF [FURNISH 8" RESTRAINED JOINT PIPE §11.21 [$ 24,437.80 $1261 | § 2748980
6 | 1,760 | LF [FURNISH 4" RESTRAINED JOINT PIFE $341 |3 6,001.60 5473 |5 832480
7 | 98 | LF [FURNISH 15" SDR 35 PVC ENCASEMENT PIPE w/ SPACERS $1365 |5 133770 | §1453 |3 142384
8 | 80 | LF [FURNISH 12" X 0.375" STEEL ENGASEMENT PIPE w/ SPACERS §18.00 | §  1,520.00 $41.77 | §  3341.60
9 4| EA JFURNISH 8~ GATE VALVE w/ ADJUSTABLE VALVE BOX & RESTRAINTS | 3$865.00 |5  3,460.00 $903.34 | §_ 36213
10 | 5 | EA [FURNISH 6" GATE VALVE w/ ADJUSTABLE VALVE BOX & RESTRAINTS |~ $575.00 | §  2,875.00 §$508.20 |'S 298145
11 8 | EA [FURNISH 4" GATE VALVE wf ADJUSTABLE VALVE BOX & RESTRAINTS | $446.00 | 3.582.00 $477.20 | §  3817.60
12 | 2 | EA [FURNISH 2" GATE VALVE w/ ADJ VALVE BOX & RESTRAINTS $402.00 |§  804.00 $34286 | $ 68532
13 | 3. |'EA |FURNISH 2" BLOWOFF VALVE ASS'Y (PER DETAIL, INCLU GATE VALVE)| _$345.00 | §  1,035.00 §450.04 [§ 1,370.82
14 | 4 | EA']FURNISH ¥4 AIR RELEASE VALVE ASSEMBLY FOR 8" WATER MAIN $300.00 | §  1,200.00 §362.80 | 5  1.451.60
15 | 2 | EA [FURNISH 34" AIR RELEASE VALVE ASSEMBLY FOR 6" WATER MAIN $283.00 [S 566,00 $34626 |3 092.52
16 | 5 | EA|FURNISH 34" AIR RELEASE VALVE ASSEMBLY FOR 4" WATER MAIN $276.00 | S 1,380.00| [ 833088 |3 1,854.85 |
17 | 18 | EA |[FURNISH 8 X 3/4" BRASS SERVICE SADDLE $50.40 | § 85440 | 96588 {$ 109408 |
18 | 1 { EA |[FURNISH 6" X 314" BRASS SERVICE SADDLE 53880 | § 38.80 $47.8¢ |3 47.84
19_| 11 | EA'|FURNISH 4" X 3/4" BRASS SERVICE SADDLE $26.00 |§ 286,00 $3214 !5 3m354
20 | 28 | EA {FURNISH /4" CORP STOP $27.70_ | § 77580 §3411 |5 955.08
21 | 18 | EA [FURNISH 3/4" ANGLE STOP $37.51 |§  675.18 $4632 | S 83376
22 | 18 | EA [FURNISH 3/4" BALL VALVE (BRASS) $8.00 1§ 14400 §1131 | 20358
23 | 18 | EA |FURNISH 3/4° BRASS COMPRESSION COUPLING $1545 [ § — 278.10 $2070 |5 37260
24 | 900 | LF |FURNISH 3/4" ENDOTRACE POLYETHYLENE TUBING $0.83 | §  &37.00 S0.94 |$  846.00
25_| 6100 | LF [FURNISH 1" SCH. 40 PVC PIPE $027__[§ 1,847.00 $0.23 | § 1,403.00
26 | 320 | LF |[FURNISH 2" SCH. 40 PVC ENCASEMENT PIPE §084  [§ 172.80 5043 [S  156.80
27 | 18 | EA [FURNISH STANDARD METER BOX w/ COVER $1660 |§  207.00 §1661 | s 20898
28 | 18 | EA [FURNISH VALVE MARKERS w/ POST $0.00° [§ 17100 S687 |5  iB4Ba
29 | 20 [ EA |FURNISH WATER LINE MARKERS w/ POST §6.00  |§  180.00 $8.87 | § 17740
30 | 55 | EA |WIRESPLICER $200 {8 11000 5103 [§ 66.55
31 | 2 | EA |[FURNISH 15" X 8" END SEALS $3850 |s 77.00 $41.01 |8 82.02
32 | 2 | EA |FURNISH 12" X 6" END SEALS §32.20 |§ 84,40 $36.01 | § 72.02
33 [26,500] LF |FURNISH TRACER WIRE 5009 [$  2,385.00 §0.06  [§ 159000
34_| 54 | EA |FURNISH 3/4" STAINLESS STEEL INSERT $130 |5 70.20 §1.02 |8 55.08
35 | 18| EA |FURNISH /4" METER COUPLING $812  |$  146.16 $489 [ § 88.02
36 | 28 | EA [FURNISH3/4" C44-33G MOLE ADAPTER $13.00 [§  184.00 $1583 | 43784
37_| 4 | EA [FURNISH PVC GEMENT (QUART) $1450 |§ 56.00 §13.70_ [ § 54.80
38 | 4 | EA [FURNISHPURPLE PRIMER (QUART) $11.00 [§ 44,00 §1279 |8 51.16
38 | 11 [ EA |WASHED GRAVEL (50# BAGS) $6.00 |s 66.00 5415 |§ 45.65
40 ~ |FURNISH MISC FITTINGS: [NCLUDES RESTRAINTS, BOLTS, GASKETS
8 1| EA[2"96° MJ BEND §86.00 |5 86.00 59862 [$ 96,82
b 2 | EAJe"MJTEE $182.00 {§ 384,00 520557 |8 411.14
c 1 | EAJ&"MJTEE $12000 (§  120.00 $14308 [s  143.06
d 3 | EA[4"X2"MITEE §152.00 [§  466.00 $168.50 [$  505.50
e 1_VEA [8"X4"MITEE $208.00 | $§  208.00 520225 | 5 20225
f 1| EA (6" 807 M BEND $17200 (5 172.00 519398 |[§ 19398
g 4 | EA |8745° MJBEND $168.00 | §  632.00 $176.00 | § 71200
h 1| EA |B"SLEEVE $17500 | §  175.00 $19509 [$ 19509
I 1| EA |6"SLEEVE $12000 | $ 120,00 513371 [$ 1337
J 2 | EA [4"SLEEVE $87.00 [§5 17400 $9567 | § 19174
K 2 | EA J2"SLEEVE $9200 [§  184.00 §10365 |[§$  207.30
1 2| EA |2"MJPLUG $25.00 | § 50.00 $5851 | §  197.02
m 1| EA |4"X2"MJREDUCER $87.00 | ¢ 97.00 §10830 [§  108.30
n 3| EA [6"X 4" MJ REDUCER $94.00 |5 282.00 '3106.06_ [ 5. 31818
0 1| EA [6*X 8" MJREDUCER $12600 |5 128.00 $14378 [§ 14378
p 1| EA [10"X8"MJREDUCER $19500 1§ 195.00 $21830 [$ 21830
q 6 | EA |[4"RIXIPSCOUPLING ‘ $87.00 |§ 52200 $9587 |$ 57522
r_| 10 | EA [6"RJXIPS COUPLING — | $175.00 |5 1,750.00 $19500 | §  1,850.90
s | 24 | EA [HTH CHLORINE (6% CONTAINERS) $1450 |§  348.00 $17.45 | § 41160
TOTAL AWMOUNT SCHEDULE "A" BID § 140,501.34 § 161,024.78




UPSHUR COUNTY FOR UNION GROVE WSC, STEP #7218036

CONTRACT 2 - MATERIALS ONLY IEOR WATER MAINS

Tuesday, June 11 2010 at 10:00 a.m.
_ _BID TABULATION
I I
Hayes Pipe Supply, Inc. Core & Main. LP _
TEM | QTY |oNim|~ ~ DESCRIFTION Longview, TX Tyler, TX__ N
SCHEDULE "8" BID
1 [10,500] LF {FURNISH 8" WATER MAIN ) $5.02 [ § 52,710.00 $5.02 |5 53,445.00
2 115,300] LF [FURNISH 6° WATER MAIN - 5286 | 5 45288.00 $303 | 5 _46,359.00
3 [ 20 [ LF |FURNISH 2" WATER MAIN - $043_ [ $ 8.60 $054 |8 10.80
4 2,180 | LF |FURNISH §° RESTRAINED JOINT PIPE 81121 | §_ 24,437.80 $1261 | § 27.469.80
7577|1760 | LF_|FURNISH 6° RESTRAINED JOINT PIPE | s Ts s00180 $6.05 | & 14,185.60
8 | 88 | LF [FURNISH 15" SDR 35 PVC ENCASEMENT PIPE W/ SPACERS §1385 [§ 13370 | 81504 | s 1.478.92
7| 80 | LF IFURNISH 12" X 0.375° STEEL ENCASEMENT PIPE w/ SPACERS 81900 |8 1,52000 | |7 $41.76 | §  3,340.80
__B_| 4 | EA|FURNISH 8" GATE VALVE w/ ADJUSTABLE VALVE BOX & RESTRAINTS | $865.00 | $ $905.18 |5 3620.76
8 | 13 | EA |FURNISH 6" GATE VALVE w/ ADJUSTABLE VALVE BOX & RESTRAINTS | 557500 | $ $696.18 | §  7,750.94
10 | 2~ | EA [FURNISH 2" GATE VALVE wf ADJ VALVE BOX & RESTRAINTS $402.00 |~ &0 $34261 1§ ees.22
11 | 3 | EA JFURNISH 2" BLOWOFF VALVE ASS'Y (PER DETAIL, INCLU GATE VALVE)| $345.00 | § 1,03500 | '| '$45988 | §  1,379.64
12 | 4 | €A [FURNISH 3/4" AIR RELEASE VALVE ASSEMBLY FOR 8" WATER MAIN $300.00 |§ 1,200.00 | | "$36420 |5 1.456.80 |
13 | 7 | EA |FURNISH 3/4° AR RELEASE VALVE ASSEMBLY FOR 6" WATER MAIN $283.00 |5 1,081.00 534589 |5 242133
14_| 16 | EA |FURNISH 8° X 3/4* BRASS SERVICE SADDLE $5340 |5 85440 $6587 _|'$  1053.92
15 | 12 | EA [FURNISH 6" X 3/4” BRASS SERVICE SADDLE $38.80 |5 46560 | | 84793 |5 657518
16 | 28 | EA |FURNISH 34" CORP STOP $2770 |§ 77580 | | $34.11 |5 94508
17 | 18 | EA {FURNISH 3/4" ANGLE STOP $37.51_ |$ 67518 | "$4631 [§ 83358
18 | 18 | EA"JFURNISH 3/4° BALL VALVE (BRASS) $800 I's 14400 | "s1i31 | 20a.58
19 ;18 | EA |FURNISH 3/4" BRASS COMPRESSION COUPLING $1545 | § 27840 $2069 |§ 3724z
20 | 800 | LF_|FURNISH 3/4" ENDOTRACE POLYETHYLENE TUBING $063 |$  837.001 $0.94 |§_ 846.00
21| 6100 | LF [FURNISH 1" SCH. 40 PVC FIPE $027 |s 1Bar0| | 5033 |S  1,403.00
22 | 320 | LF [FURNISH 2" SCH. 40 PVC ENCASEMENT PIPE $0.54 |§_ | §048 1s 156,80
_23 | 19 | EA [FURNISH STANDARD METER BOX w/ COVER $1650 [§ 31 §1661 (5 31569
24 | 18 | EA [FURNISH VALVE MARKERS w/ POST §9.00 |3 $8.87 1§ 150.66
25 | 20 | EA |[FURNISH WATER LINE MARKERS w/ POST §900 1§ $8.87 (8§ 177.40
25 | 56 | EA |WIRE SPLICER $200 % $1.03_ [ S 56,65
27 | 2 | EA [FURNISH 15" X §" END SEALS R E $4100 | § 82.00
28 | 2 | EA |[FURNISH 12" X 6" END SEALS - T §3220 |3 64.40 $36.01 1§ 72.02
29" |26,500( LF JFURNISH TRACER WIRE $0.08 | § 2,385.00 5005 1§  1,690.00
30 | 54 | EA |[FURNISH 3/4" STAINLESS STEEL INSERT A $1.30 | 70.20 $1.02__ | s 55.08
31 | 18 [ EA [FURNISH 3/4" METER COUPLING 5612 |§ _ 146.16 $489 |8 88.02
32 | 28 | EA |FURNISH3/4" C84-33G MOLE ADAPTER $13.00 |5 364.00 $1563 |5 43764
33 | 4 | EA [FURNISHPVC CEMENT (QUART) o $14.50 |5 58.00 $1370_ | § 54.80 |
34 | 4 | FA |FURNISHPURPLE PRIMER (QUART) - $11.00 | 44.00 $1279 [§ 5116
3 | 11 | EA |WASHED GRAVEL (50# BAGS) o $6.00 | 66.00 $415 |5 4585
36 FURNISH MISC FITTINGS: |NCLUDES RESTRAINTS, BOLTS, & GASKETS
a 1 | EA |2"50° MJBEND o 58600 | $ 86.00 $98.62
b [ 3 !EA|EMITEE T $182.00 |5 54600 $205,53 )
c 3 | EA [e*X2"MJTEE ~ $280.00 | $ 84000 $314.75
d 1 _| EA [8"X 4" MITEE $206.00 |5  208.00 $232.21
e 1| EA 6" 90° MJ BEND &__ §172.00 | $ 17200 $193.84 ’
f 4| EA ["45° MIBEND o $156.00 [ § 632,00 $177.97 R
g 1| EA |B"SLEEVE $176.00 [§ 17500 $195.08
h | 3 |EA|6SLEEVE $12000 [§  360.00 $13368
1 2| EA | SLEEVE T $9200 |$__ 184.00 §103.64 B
[ 2| EA |2 MIPLUG §2500 |§ 50.00 $58.51
k 1 ! EA |[4"XZ"MJREDUCER - $97.00 1§ 97.00 $108.29
[ 1| EA'|8"X 4" MJREDUCER $9400 |3 94.00 §106.03
m | 1 | EA |6" X8 MJREDUCER $128.00 | § _ 128.00 $143.75 N
n 1| EA J10"X 8" MJ REDUCER i §186.00 | §  196.00 5218.25
o | 8 |EA 8" RIXIPS COUFLING N $120.00 | § 72000 $13366
P | 10 | EA [8"RJXIPS COUPLING T 317500 | § 175080 | $19%80
g | 24 | EA [HTHCHLORINE (52 CONTAINERS). $1450 |5 34896 [ Yo $13F S5 47160
'row,_@mqum' SCHEDULE "E" BID § 163,733p4 | &7 C. [-5 180,662.81
r— —= i
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